

2024 Garbage and Recycle Bid Tabulation

Base: 1 Toter per household (garbage only)

Provider	Year 1	Year 2	Year 3	Year 4	Year 5	Year 6	Alt. Year 7	Alt. Year 8	8-year ave.	1 Bulk Item/month in Base
Best Way	\$ 16.22	\$ 16.87	\$ 17.54	\$ 18.24	\$ 18.97	\$ 19.73	\$ 20.51	\$ 21.33	\$ 18.68	Yes
Priority	\$ 12.50	\$ 12.88	\$ 13.27	\$ 13.67	\$ 14.08	\$ 14.50	\$ 14.94	\$ 15.39	\$ 13.90	Yes
Republic Services	\$ 16.54	\$ 17.38	\$ 18.24	\$ 19.15	\$ 20.10	\$ 21.11	\$ 22.17	\$ 23.27	\$ 19.75	Yes
Rumpke	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
Waste Management	\$ 13.47	\$ 14.01	\$ 14.57	\$ 15.15	\$ 15.76	\$ 16.39	Negotiation	Negotiation	\$ 14.89	Yes

Additional Toter

Yes/No	Cost	64 gallon	Cost of 64
Best Way	Yes	\$ 6.00	Yes \$ 6.00
Priority	Yes	\$125	Yes See bid * \$125 up front but no additional monthly cost; will service currently owned bins but no warranty
Republic Services	Yes	\$ 7.50	Yes \$ 7.50
Rumpke	No bid	No bid	No bid
Waste Management	Yes	\$ 10.75	Yes \$ 9.50

Town Facility Cost

8 Yard	6 Yard	4 Yard	2 Yard	Toter
Best Way	\$ 160.00	\$ 130.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 90.00 \$ 20.00
Priority	Included	Included	Included	Included * current facilities plus 5 additional included in bid
Republic Services	\$ 126.20	\$ 105.18	\$ 76.79	\$ 64.96 \$ 16.54
Rumpke	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Waste Management	\$ 125.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 90.00 \$ 20.00

Recycling @ Town Hall- 4- 8-yard dumpsters 3 times per week

Provider	Year 1	Year 2	Year 3	Year 4	Year 5	Year 6	Alt. Year 7	Alt. Year 8
Best Way	\$ 1,250.00	\$ 1,250.00	\$ 1,250.00	\$ 1,288.00	\$ 1,288.00	\$ 1,288.00	\$ 1,326.00	\$ 1,326.00
Priority* alternative	\$450/ haul	\$450/ haul	\$450/ haul	\$450/ haul	\$450/ haul	\$450/ haul	\$450/ haul	\$450/ haul
Republic Services	\$ 1,514.24	\$ 1,589.95	\$ 1,669.45	\$ 1,752.92	\$ 1,840.57	\$ 1,932.60	\$ 2,029.23	\$ 2,130.69
Rumpke	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Waste Management	\$ 1,310.00	\$ 1,362.40	\$ 1,416.90	\$ 1,473.57	\$ 1,532.51	\$ 1,593.82	Negotiation	Negotiation

Recycling @ Town Hall- 4- 8-yard dumpsters 5 times per week

Provider	Year 1	Year 2	Year 3	Year 4	Year 5	Year 6	Alt. Year 7	Alt. Year 8
Best Way	\$ 2,078.00	\$ 2,078.00	\$ 2,078.00	\$ 2,141.00	\$ 2,141.00	\$ 2,141.00	\$ 2,205.00	\$ 2,205.00
Priority * alternative	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Republic Services	\$ 2,523.73	\$ 2,649.92	\$ 2,782.41	\$ 2,921.53	\$ 3,067.61	\$ 3,220.99	\$ 3,382.04	\$ 3,551.14
Rumpke	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Waste Management	\$ 1,880.00	\$ 1,955.20	\$ 2,033.41	\$ 2,114.74	\$ 2,199.33	\$ 2,287.31	Negotiation	Negotiation

Alt. #2- Curbside Recycling

Provider	Year 1	Year 2	Year 3	Year 4	Year 5	Year 6	Alt. Year 7	Alt. Year 8
----------	--------	--------	--------	--------	--------	--------	-------------	-------------

Best Way	\$ 6.00	\$ 6.24	\$ 6.49	\$ 6.75	\$ 7.02	\$ 7.30	\$ 7.59	\$ 7.89
Priority	\$ 3.00	\$ 3.09	\$ 3.18	\$ 3.28	\$ 3.38	\$ 3.48	\$ 3.58	\$ 3.69
Republic Services	\$ 3.58	\$ 3.76	\$ 3.95	\$ 4.14	\$ 4.35	\$ 4.57	\$ 4.80	\$ 5.04
Rumpke	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Waste Management	\$ 4.90	\$ 5.10	\$ 5.30	\$ 5.51	\$ 5.73	\$ 5.96	Negotiation	Negotiation

Alt. #3- Spring & Fall Yard Waste Pick up

Provider	Year 1	Year 2	Year 3	Year 4	Year 5	Year 6	Alt. Year 7	Alt. Year 8	
Best Way	\$ 1.05	\$ 1.09	\$ 1.13	\$ 1.18	\$ 1.23	\$ 1.28	\$ 1.33	\$ 1.38	
Priority	\$ 0.50	\$ 0.52	\$ 0.54	\$ 0.56	\$ 0.58	\$ 0.60	\$ 0.62	\$ 0.64	*up to 15 bags
Republic Services	Included	Included	Included	Included	Included	Included	Included	Included	
Rumpke	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	
Waste Management	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	

Alt. #4- Billing by Provider

Provider	Year 1	Year 2	Year 3	Year 4	Year 5	Year 6	Alt. Year 7	Alt. Year 8	
Best Way	\$ 2.00	\$ 2.00	\$ 2.00	\$ 2.00	\$ 2.50	\$ 2.50	\$ 2.50	\$ 2.50	
Priority	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	
Republic Services	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	
Rumpke	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	
Waste Management	\$ 2.00	\$ 2.08	\$ 2.16	\$ 2.25	\$ 2.34	\$ 2.43	Negotiation	Negotiation	